

**CITY OF MASSILLON
BID TABULATION SHEET**

PROJECT: 17st03 Richville Dr SE Improvement Project

DATE: 7/11/2018

Estimate 1,551,000.00

\$83,274.00

NAME/ADDRESS of BIDDER	PHONE AND FAX NUMBER	BID BOND OR CERTIFIED CHECK	BID FORM AMOUNT	BID TAB AMOUNT
NORTHSTAR ASPHALT, N. Canton, OH	330-497-0936 330-497-1710	X	\$ 1,505,075.60	\$ 1,505,075.60
			\$ 81,433.00	\$ 81,433.00
SUPERIOR PAVING & MATERIALS, N. Canton, OH	330-499-5849 330-499-5910	X	\$ 1,647,676.50	\$ 1,647,676.50
			\$ 90,587.84	\$ 90,601.70
CENTRAL ALLIED, Canton, OH	330-477-6751	X	\$ 1,674,285.45	\$ 1,674,993.45
			\$ 99,919.40	\$ 99,919.40
KARVO PAVING, Stow, OH	330-929-9616		NO BID	NO BID
			NO BID	NO BID
SHELLY CO, Twinsburg, OH	330-425-7861	X	\$ 1,662,346.70	\$ 1,662,353.29
			\$ 141,225.50	\$ 141,461.50
LOCKHART CONC., Akron, OH	330-745-6520	X	\$ 1,697,196.00	\$ 1,739,121.00
			\$ 92,392.50	\$ 92,393.00